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The Ex Husbands Revenge Chapter 2846-“Renee, what’s going on? What are 
you thinking about?” Leon was confused when he noticed that Renee was 
deep in thought. 

“N- nothing,” Renee snapped out of it and shook her head, still unable to 
regain her composure. 

Her mind was telling her that she could not steep so low. However, her heart 
was reluctant to let go of the only man she ever fell for. 

Instantly, the conflicting feelings within her made it hard for her to decide if 
she wanted to cave or sever all ties with Leon. 

“By the way, you said you need to talk to me about something, right? What 
was it?” Leon was oblivious to her inner struggles and changed the subject. 
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“Oh, Hugo has fulfilled your request and acquired a suitable cosmetic 
company. 

He told me to bring you over and file the paperwork. Also, all the alchemical 
pills have been produced, so he wishes to discuss matters about the 
upcoming sales drive,” Renee recalled that she came to Leon for something 
important and explained the situation. 

The thought that she could give up on competing altogether opened up a path 
for him and gave her hope. Hence, she no longer felt as devastated and was 
in a much better mood. 

Still, she could not decide whether she was willing to let go of her pride at this 
moment. 

She intended to calm down for a few days to consider her feelings for Leon, 
before making a decision. 

“Sure! I’ll go to meet Mister Morrison with you!” Leon was overjoyed. 



Apart from setting up the branch for Cynthion Group, Leon also came to set 
up a branch for Elegante Group as he wished to expand his business to the 
western region. 

Since Hugo successfully acquired a cosmetic firm, this was the last item on 
Leon’s list to check off. 

“Leon, I’ll go with you,” Iris chimed in. 

She was the director of Elegante Group and responsible for most of the 
operational matters except for important decision-making, which would be left 
in Leon’s hands. 

“Sure! Cynthia and the others should come along as well!” Leon nodded and 
looked at the others. 

With that, the group left with Renee and drove away from the hotel. 

 

The Ex Husbands Revenge Chapter 2848-In the five-star hotel, Leon, Iris, and 
the others arrived in the evening. 

Leon first reserved a few luxurious suites for the women, Chandler and Henry. 

Then, the group went to the hotel restaurant for dinner. 

After being parted from Leon for a while, Iris and the others swarmed him with 
questions about things that happened in the western region and work. 

The group dined while chatting harmoniously. 
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After dinner, they returned to Leon’s room. 

Suddenly, Leon recalled something and called Chandler and Henry over. 

“Chandler, Henry, how’s your training?” he asked. 



When he left the southern region, he taught the Heavenly star Method to his 
subordinates. On top of that, he set up a Light Convergence Circle and left 
them with alchemical pills. 

His main purpose was to increase their strength to strengthen his force. 

Some time passed so he wondered how their training went and decided to 
enquire about it. 

Chandler said gratefully. 

Before Leon left the southern region, he set a goal for Chandler to reach the 
With the help of countless means Leon provided and Chandler’s hard work, 
he He was glad that he did not disappoint Leon. 

On the other hand, his family was murdered by the Scarlet Thief. Not long 
ago, Leon eliminated the Scarlet Thief and even offered countless help to 
enhance his strength. 

Chandler never once forgot about what Leon did for him and always wanted to 
repay the debt. 

the best martial artists among the older generation in both the southern and 
western regions. 

He would be useful to Leon in eliminating potential threats and Chandler felt 
glad. 

“Good! Henry, how about you?” Leon smiled with satisfaction, then turned to 
Henry. 

However, he was the same age as Chandler and the two shared equally tragic 
pasts. 

Chandler did with Leon’s help. 

He felt slightly regretful and helpless. 

 

The Ex Husbands Revenge Chapter 2849-“It’s fine. Henry, it’s great that you 
managed to get to the Intermediate Almighty State within such a short period. 
Be more confident! So long as you keep Almighty State soon,” Leon smiled. 



He knew that Henry was slightly less talented than Chandler, so the fact that 
he rose to the Intermediate ALmighty State was already impressive. 

Hence, Leon was satisfied. 

considered top-tier in both the southern and western regions. 

With the two of them protecting the women, Leon could rest assured. 
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“By the way, how’s Mason and the others doing?’ Leon continued. 

State,” Chandler and Henry said respectfully. 

When Leon arranged for Mason to take over the underground society to 
resolve any aftermath of the defeat of the Southern Boss. The target he set for 
the five of them was to reach the Initial Almighty state within two months. 

Not long passed so far, so the five of them were yet to reach the Almighty 
State. 

Therefore, they decided to remain in the southern region to train instead of 
following Iris and the others to the western region. 

“Good!” Leon nodded. 

He knew that Mason, Spencer, and the others started late so it was a rather 
high goal for them to reach the Almighty State. 

Hence, it was normal that they were yet to succeed. 

The Heavenly Stars Method was a shortcut and an Absolute Method that 
could get martial artists at lower levels to power up within a short period. 

With the help of the Heavenly Stars Method and other means, he was certain 
that Mason and the others would reach the Almighty State soon as well. This 
would ensure that they were capable of resolving any issues that arose in the 
southern region and Leon was not in a rush. 



“Alright, Chandler, Henry, you must be exhausted for sending Iris and the 
others here. Return to your rooms to rest,” Leon said. 

She then grabbed Cynthia and Snow’s arm before intending to leave 
alongside Roanne. 

The four of them knew this and wanted to give them some time alone. 

As they were about to leave, something crossed Leon’s mind and he called 
out to them, “Hang on!” 

 

The Ex Husbands Revenge Chapter 2850-“Leon, what’s wrong? What else do 
you need?” They all turned back to him in confusion. 

“Oh, here’s the thing. I have a few pills that I’d like to give you,” Leon said and 
took out a flask containing some rainbow-colored pills. 

The pills were almost transparent and omitted extremely powerful true energy. 

“What are these?- Cynthia and the others stared at the pills in puzzlement. 

They were by Leon’s side for some time and knew almost every type of 
alchemical pill he made. However, this was the first time they saw this type of 
pill, and they were all confused by it. 
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“These are the Rainbow Pills! I made these from a heavenly herb, the 
Rainbow Fruit, and an Emperor Herb!” Leon smiled and explained. 

“What? These are made from a heavenly herb? Seriously?” They were all 
shocked. 

Though they did not know much about herbs, they all heard about heavenly 
herbs and knew that they were a few times rarer. 

To their bewilderment, Leon managed to find a Rainbow Fruit and an Emperor 
Herb. 



He was exceptionally lucky and they were all shocked. 

“Yeah, it’s true.- Leon nodded. 

“Great!” “Leon, we didn’t expect to receive such great gifts after not seeing 
you for a while. We love you!” Iris and the others were overjoyed. 

Ruth was always talented and obsessed with martial arts. 

The Rainbow Pills were made from the Rainbow Fruit and Emperor Herb, 
which meant that their effect would surpass the Motherwort Pill she once took. 

Hence, she would surely power up with it. 

Instantly, she was overwhelmed by excitement and grinned from ear to ear. 

Unable to contain her excitement, she hugged Leon and came close to giving 
him a few kisses. 

Hence, they only rolled their eyes at her for hugging Leon but did not think 
much of it. 

 


