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Seeing this, Ning Zhi’s body was shaken by the black air. With a low shout, his body 
dissipated like a phantom, and then he caught up with David in an instant! 

The black air surged wildly, turning into a huge palm, and slapped David! 

David seemed to have guessed Ning Zhi’s move. When Ning Zhi slapped him, David’s 
figure suddenly disappeared! 

But the blue-clothed monk in front of David was miserable. He couldn’t dodge in time 
and was hit by Ning Zhi’s palm. With a muffled groan, blood spurted out of his mouth, 
and his whole body was like a kite with a broken line, hitting the ground heavily! 

“Damn…” 

Ning Zhi couldn’t help but burst out a swear word! 

With the blue-clothed monk’s body hitting the ground heavily, as if it instantly injected 
power into the demon-subduing formation, countless dazzling spiritual lights rushed up 
like stars. This time, the spiritual light was a thousand times more dazzling than the 
spiritual light that consumed the immortal stone! And 

the green-clothed monk was shrinking rapidly, visibly aging, and the breath on his body 
disappeared in an instant! 

No one expected that this demon-subduing formation could actually absorb the breath 
of demon cultivators as resources! 

Even David himself did not expect it! 

This time, all the demon cultivators were shocked. They originally thought that when the 
formation appeared, they just needed to find a way to break the formation, but in this 
situation, as long as they approached the formation, they would become the 
consumption resources of the demon-subduing formation! 

The next scene instantly made everyone jump with fear, even David was no exception! 

I saw waves of shattering sounds, and the violent breath of the void radiated to the 
surroundings! 



Then, dense void cracks appeared one by one, and continued to spread to the 
surroundings! 

The dark void cracks were like the huge mouths of monsters, and the infinite suction 
was sucking everything! 

Looking at so many void cracks that suddenly appeared, David’s forehead was 
sweating instantly! 

This time it seems to be a bit big! 

If you are really sucked into the void cracks, you may never come back! 

Those demon cultivators and Ning Zhi looked at the void cracks that appeared, and they 
were immediately frightened pale and screamed! 

Sometimes death is not scary, but the unknown area is scary! 

No one knows what is behind these void cracks! 

As the demon cultivators were sucked into the void cracks, they screamed, and some 
were directly smashed by the void cracks and turned into a pool of meat paste! 

Even though these are all cultivators in the Tribulation Realm, or even in the Mahayana 
Realm, they still look so small in front of these void cracks! 

A large amount of sea water began to pour back, and the originally exposed peaks were 
swallowed up by the sea water in an instant, and the exposed formations were also 
covered up! 

“David, what the hell are you playing at? Can you still live after being sucked into that 
void crack?” 

Ning Zhi cursed David, and was so angry that he almost died. It seemed that David 
really wanted to die together with him in order to kill him! 

What a fu**ing pervert… 

David was also speechless when he looked at the furious Ning Zhi. He didn’t expect it to 
be like this! 

“Don’t curse me, don’t you see that I’m also avoiding the void cracks? How could I know 
it would turn out like this?” 

“It’s all your fault. You insisted on letting that idiot destroy my formation, and it turned 
out like this.” 



David said while avoiding the suction of the void cracks! 

Ning Zhi was stunned. He didn’t expect David to blame him. 

While resisting the suction of the vortex and dodging to the side, Ning Zhi looked at 
David: “You told me you didn’t know about the formation you set up? Wait until you 
avoid these void cracks, and see how I will peel off your skin and pull out your 
tendons…” 

“I don’t know who will peel off who yet, just wait and see…” 

David and Ning Zhi could only talk nonsense! 

No one dared to take action, and now all their energy could only be spent on avoiding 
those void cracks! 

David and Ning Zhi were lucky enough to avoid those void cracks and not be sucked in! 
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But those demon cultivators were miserable. They screamed and were sucked into the 
void cracks. They didn’t know whether they were strangled or sent directly to another 
world. Anyway, they couldn’t come back! 

David and Ning Zhi desperately avoided the void cracks, and slowly the void cracks 
became fewer and fewer! 

In the end, the void cracks disappeared completely, and the entire demon-subduing 
formation stopped working, and all the resources were consumed! 

Ning Zhi’s teeth were clattering at this time, staring at David intently, and then rushed 
towards David with big strides! 

While rushing towards David, Ning Zhi raised his hand and shot out black air all over the 
sky! 

Seeing this, David shot out a group of fire, which collided with Ning Zhi’s black air! 

David did not dodge, and he planned to fight Ning Zhi head-on! 

Without the threat of other demon cultivators, David was not afraid of Ning Zhi! 



What’s more, he still had many means to use! 

The God King Bow, the magic whip, and even his own true fire body, these are all 
David’s means! Especially 

the magic whip, which is specially used to restrain the magic cultivator like Ning Zhi! 

David also has the Fire Kirin and the Sky Devouring Beast. If these two little guys can 
jump out, it will be enough for Ning Zhi to drink a pot! 

Now David still has the secret book of the Ten Thousand Swords Sect in his hand, 
which is also a means! 

David’s last means of saving his life is the Red Cloud Demon Lord. If he reaches the 
time and space of life and death, David will not care so much and can let the Red Cloud 
Demon Lord control his body! 

At that time, Ning Zhi is still a fart, just a little trash! 

With so many means, David is confident and confident in his heart! 

When David shot out a breath of fire, the whole person rushed towards Ning Zhi! 

Seeing this, Ning Zhi smiled coldly: “You want to fight me in close combat, let me see 
how strong your body is!” 

Ning Zhi knew that David’s body had been tempered and was extremely strong, but he 
was not afraid. After all, the gap between their realms was so big, he wanted to try to 
fight David head-on! 

Boom! 

Ning Zhi and David collided instantly! 

Even if it was just a collision that just touched, it still made a shocking sound! 

David’s fist was flashing with golden light. Without the slightest hesitation, he turned 
around and punched Ning Zhi again! 

“Holy Light Fist…” The sky 

was full of golden light, gushing out! 

Ning Zhi was not to be outdone: “Flame Fist…” 

Ning Zhi also punched out, and the sky was full of flames, rising up! 



Boom boom boom… 

The sky and the earth changed color instantly, and the endless golden light and flames 
merged, reflecting the entire sky red! 

Ning Zhi’s face changed slightly, because he could sense that David’s fist was indeed a 
bit powerful, which made his arm slightly stinging! 

“Damn, this kid’s fist is a bit hard…” 

Ning Zhi punched desperately, feeling a little panic in his heart! 

He really didn’t expect that with such a big gap in realm, David’s strength in close 
combat was also so strong, especially the Holy Light Fist, which was a bit 
overwhelming! 

In a flash, the two people actually punched hundreds of times, and Ning Zhi was getting 
more and more frightened! 

And David was getting more and more excited, and his fighting spirit was high! 

Ning Zhi began to retreat a little, because he felt that his arm could not hold up! 

He didn’t understand, how could David be so strong with the power of his body? 

Ning Zhi didn’t know at all that David’s Holy Light Fist was an immortal technique. The 
more the body power, the more powerful the Holy Light Fist! 

Bang! 

After another punch, Ning Zhi’s fist suddenly made a crisp sound, the whole fist bone 
shattered, and a lot of blood spurted out! 

But David was intact, and he didn’t look injured at all! 

“Your body is too abnormal…” 

Ning Zhi retreated helplessly, looking at his fist, his face full of resentment! 

If I had known this, I would not have fought David at close range! 

My hand was injured, and my combat effectiveness will definitely decrease! 
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“Ning Zhi, whether it’s a close combat or a long-range battle, you are just a little trash in 
front of me.” 

David looked at the injured Ning Zhi, and said with a slight smile! 

“Really? Then try it again…” 

Ning Zhi followed David and pulled away! 

He had the furnace in his hand, and he could replenish his breath at any time. He didn’t 
believe that he couldn’t consume David! 

Ning Zhi grabbed it casually, and the black air in the sky instantly condensed into a 
spear, and then shot straight at David! Just 

when the spear was shot towards David, it suddenly exploded in mid-air! Then 

countless short and powerful arrow feathers came towards David like meteors in the 
sky! 

It turned out that the spear was to confuse David at the beginning, making David 
mistakenly think that it was just a spear, and there was no need to dodge at all! 

David looked at the arrows that suddenly filled the sky, and grabbed the jade slip secret 
book of the Ten Thousand Sword Sect in his hand. 

As David’s spiritual consciousness entered the jade slip secret book, in just a moment, 
countless sword techniques flashed through David’s mind! 

“Ten Thousand Swords Return to the Sect…” 

David’s eyes were like lightning, and the sword energy on the Dragon 

Slashing Sword was crisscrossed. David held up the Dragon Slashing Sword, and 
endless spiritual energy swarmed around him, constantly gathering on David’s Dragon 
Slashing Sword! 

The Dragon Slashing Sword trembled slightly, and countless sword beams shot out 
from the Dragon Slashing Sword! 

Ten Thousand Swords Return to the Sect, and sword beams were like a gust of wind 
cutting the moon, crossing the endless void, and then collided with Ning Zhi’s arrows! 

“Ten Thousand Swords Return to the Sect?” 



“Isn’t this the unique skill of the Ten Thousand Sword Sect? How do you know the 
sword skills of the Ten Thousand Sword Sect?” 

Ning Zhi looked at the scene in front of him, his face full of disbelief! 

He couldn’t understand, how could David know the unique skills of the Ten Thousand 
Sword Sect? David was definitely not a disciple of the Ten Thousand Sword Sect! 

However, now David knows the unique skills of the Wanjian Sect. Although the power 
he displayed is still lacking, this move of Wanjian Guizong caught Ning Zhi off guard! 

After destroying Ning Zhi’s countless arrows, the remaining sword beams rushed 
straight towards Ning Zhi! 

Ning Zhi was shocked and felt that the power of this sword beam was extremely strange 
and extremely powerful! 

Ning Zhi didn’t dare to take it hard, so he could only make a move casually. Countless 
black air formed a shield and blocked Ning Zhi. At the same time, Ning Zhi’s body was 
constantly retreating! 

Ding ding ding… 

The sword beam hit the shield and made a sound like metal collision! 

But soon, the shield was defeated, and sword beams passed around Ning Zhi’s body! 

Although Ning Zhi tried his best to dodge, he was still a little slow! 

There were several wounds on his body caused by the sharp sword beams, and blood 
kept pouring out! 

Ning Zhi’s breath weakened instantly, and countless black air wrapped around the 
wound, stopping the blood instantly! 

“David, you are awesome, but I won’t let you off easily!” 

Ning Zhi spat out a mouthful of blood, which fell into the black air, instantly causing the 
air to surge. The black air was actually filled with a red air, and the two airs entangled 
together, and then turned into a long sword! 

The black hilt and the blood-red sword body exuded a hot breath! 

The furnace on Ning Zhi’s body also began to emit flames, and all these flames were 
absorbed by the long sword! 



“You want to play swords with me?” 

David raised the corner of his mouth. The Dragon Slashing Sword in his hand was a 
magical weapon, which was not comparable to the long sword that Ning Zhi used magic 
energy to transform! 

“Flame Slash…” 

Ning Zhi roared, and the long sword in his hand fiercely slashed towards David! 

In an instant, a rising flame shot out from the long sword, and the energy contained 
endless flames, and went straight to David! 

Seeing this, David also raised the Dragon Slashing Sword high. 

“Cut the sky…” 

It was another sword technique of the Wanjian Sect. With this sword, a dark space 
crack appeared in the surrounding void! 

So many space cracks had just appeared, which made David and Ning Zhi very 
embarrassed! 

This time, David’s sword actually cut out another void crack! 

The void crack appeared, but it did not close immediately. Instead, a large amount of 
breath flowed out from the void crack. No one knew where this breath came from! 
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All these auras converged towards the Dragon Slaying Sword like flowing water! 

Ning Zhi looked at the sword and was stunned. His pupils shrank and he was extremely 
shocked! 

You know, although David’s Ten Thousand Swords Returned to the Sect was very 
powerful, David obviously failed to reach its maximum strength when he used it! 

But this sword, the sword light that cut the sky, made Ning Zhi feel a terrifying threat of 
death! 



“David, how much of the swordsmanship of the Ten Thousand Swords Sect do you 
know? Are you a direct disciple of the Ten Thousand Swords Sect?” 

“These are all the unique skills of the Ten Thousand Swords Sect. It is impossible for an 
outsider like you to learn them.” 

“When did you learn them secretly?” 

Ning Zhi was a little confused at this moment, and questioned David loudly! 

“If I tell you that I just learned these swordsmanship of the Ten Thousand Swords Sect, 
would you believe it?” 

David said with a cold smile! 

Ning Zhi was stunned, then he seemed to understand and said: “Could it be that the 
secret book 

of the Ten Thousand Swords Sect is already in your hands? You saved Zhu Qingxiu for 
the secret book, right?” Ning Zhi figured it out at this time. David must have the secret 
book of the Ten Thousand Swords Sect! 

As long as one is talented, after the spiritual sense scans the secret book, those sword 
techniques will appear in the sea of consciousness! 

One can learn a few moves by copying others. For someone like David, it is not 
impossible to learn the unique skills of the Ten Thousand Swords Return to the Sect in 
an instant. 

But the power is not up to par! 

Ning Zhi believes that if he gets the secret book of the Ten Thousand Swords Sect, he 
can also learn the sword techniques in it in an instant! 

“Bullshit, I’m not as dirty as you think. This secret book was given to me by Zhu Qingxiu 
himself.” 

“Just prepare to die. I don’t have time to talk to you…” 

After David finished speaking, he slashed down with the Dragon Slaying Sword in his 
hand! 

Seeing this, Ning Zhi did not dare to hesitate at all, and took out the furnace directly. In 
an instant, the furnace exploded directly, and endless flames flew all over the sky! 



David looked at such a good furnace, but it was exploded by Ning Zhi. He was 
immediately distressed, and he wanted to grab it! 

“Master, save me…” 

Ning Zhi shouted loudly in the bursting flame! 

Just as Ning Zhi finished shouting, a figure appeared faintly in the endless flame! 

The master’s figure was so blurred that it was impossible to tell whether it was a man or 
a woman! 

The moment the figure appeared, David felt unprecedented pressure! 

A huge palm slapped towards David! 

David frowned when he saw this, but the sword also slashed towards the huge palm! 

Boom! 

Seeing David’s sword slashing, Ning Zhi was really scared, but David’s sword was 
gently blocked by the huge palm! 

With a loud bang, the sword light that David burst out was actually shattered into pieces. 

With just this one blow, David discovered the gap between himself and the figure! 

It was obvious that the other party was a projection, so it was impossible for his strength 
to burst out completely! 

But even so, David didn’t have the strength to strike in front of him! 

Ning Zhi was overjoyed when he saw this. Seeing David’s frustrated look, he shouted 
loudly: “Master, kill him, kill him now…” 

David held the Dragon Slaying Sword, his body retreated rapidly, and his face became 
very ugly! 

“Senior, I’m afraid you really need to take action this time, otherwise I will be finished…” 

David could only ask the Red Cloud Demon Lord to come forward ! 

Otherwise, with his little ability, 



he would be slapped to death by others! “Hahaha, you finally thought it through, don’t 
worry, although this old thing is just a projected shadow, I also let his body suffer heavy 
damage.” 

The Red Cloud Demon Lord laughed and instantly occupied David’s body! 

“Master, don’t hesitate, kill him…” 

Ning Zhi was still urging his master! 

But the shadow’s voice trembled at this time: “Shut up, that kid actually has the aura of 
a strong man, run quickly…” 

The shadow waved his hand and directly wrapped Ning Zhi, and instantly disappeared 
in the endless flames! 

“Damn, why the hell did he run away? I haven’t even stretched my muscles yet…” 

The Red Cloud Demon Lord was anxious and cursed! 
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David looked at Ning Zhi who was running away, and he was often relieved! 

If they continued to fight, both sides would definitely be injured! 

“Okay, let’s run away. If we continue to fight, how can my body bear it!” 

David glared at the Red Cloud Demon Lord! 

This guy only knows how to fight, without considering whether he can bear it! 

“You guy, hurry up and improve your physical strength, otherwise find all my bones 
quickly so that I can restore my physical body!” 

“I’m going to suffocate in your sea of consciousness, and it’s okay to have a 
companion…” 

said the Red Cloud Demon Lord! 

David was speechless for a while. This guy was in his sea of consciousness. Which 
residual soul dared to enter his sea of consciousness! 



After regaining control of his body, David began to rush to Zhujia Town! 

………… 

Zhujia Town! 

This is just a small town with only 10,000 people, and the strength of the town is not 
strong! 

Zhu Yuanji, the governor of Zhujia Town, is only at the ninth level of the Tribulation 
Realm! 

However, even at the ninth level of the Tribulation Realm, he is considered a master in 
the Eastern Region! 

The overall strength of the Eastern Region cultivators is weaker than that of the other 
four regions! 

This is also because the Eastern Region is vast and sparsely populated! 

In addition, the Eastern Region is blocked by the Ink Sea and the Dead Sea on both 
sides, so that the Eastern Region cultivators who want to communicate with other 
regions can only take spirit boats, airships, etc., except for the teleportation array! 

These are all modes of transportation that require a large amount of spirit coins or 
resources, so that the strength of the Eastern Region cultivators is relatively low, and 
most of them have not traveled to other places! 

At this time, in the largest courtyard in the center of Zhujia Town, Zhu Yuanji was crying 
with joy as he looked at Zhu Qingxiu in front of him! 

He thought his daughter was dead, but she didn’t expect to appear in front of him! 

“My good daughter, I have been looking for you for so many years, and finally I see you. 
You are finally home.” 

“After the demise of the Wanjian Sect, do you know how worried your father is about 
you?” 

“No matter what difficulties you encounter in the future, remember to come home. No 
matter what, your father will always be your strong backing!” 

Zhu Yuanji cried bitterly, his eyes full of heartache! 

His daughter must have suffered a lot and suffered a lot in these years outside! 



“Father, I… I really don’t want to implicate Zhujia Town, so I never dared to go home.” 

“I know I was wrong, and I will never make my father sad in the future…” 

Zhu Qingxiu also cried! 

Zhu Qingyue’s eyes were also red when she saw this! 

The family was finally reunited… 

“Master, Qi Heng from Qijia Town is here, and he got the news that the second lady is 
back.” 

At this time, Liu Bo came and said! 

When he heard that Qi Heng was coming, Zhu Qingyue frowned tightly, with disgust on 
his face! 

Zhu Yuanji also frowned. If he hadn’t been forced, he wouldn’t have embarrassed his 
daughter! 

“Father, Xiaoyue is going to marry Qi Heng. Isn’t this like putting flowers on cow dung?” 

“Qi Heng is not only extremely ugly, but also a beast. I heard about it even when I was 
in Wanjian Sect. Qi Heng raped women and bullied children…” 

“He is simply not a human being. Even for the sake of profit, you can’t let your sister 
sacrifice…” 

Zhu Qingxiu questioned Zhu Yuanji. 

After hearing this, Zhu Yuanji couldn’t help but sighed and said, “Hey, what can I do? 
When Wanjian Sect was glorious, you were in Wanjian Sect and could support our 
Zhujia Town.” 

“But now Wanjian Sect is destroyed, and Qijia Town has someone to support it, and 
doesn’t take our Zhujia Town seriously at all.” 

“If I don’t agree and marry your sister, I’m afraid that all the tens of thousands of people 
in our Zhujia Town will be killed!” 

Zhu Yuanji also looked helpless. As the governor of Zhujia Town, he must consider 
everyone in Zhujia Town! 

 


