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Chapter 4196 

David did not speak, but looked at Nie Hong coldly, with murderous intent in his eyes! 

Feeling the murderous intent in David’s eyes, Nie Hong shut her mouth and dared not 
look directly at David! 

Now that the moral hat is put on, it is no longer effective! 

“You should confess the truth. If I produce evidence, you two brothers and sisters will 
surely die.” 

David said coldly! 

When Nie Lei heard it, he knelt down to David with a plop!Nie 

Hong looked at her brother, and finally knelt down helplessly! 

“Fellow Daoist Chen, we were wrong, we were wrong. It was because we were blinded 
by our own interests that we did such a thing.” 

“Please spare our lives, Fellow Daoist Chen. We will never dare to do it again.” 

“Then Su Tianshuo promised us that as long as he caught you, he would give part of 
the Hundred Years of Offerings of the Demon Sealing League to us brothers and 
sisters.” 

“We brothers and sisters have no family and no one to rely on. Although we have joined 
the Central Region Pharmacist Association, we are also at the bottom. We are not 
qualified to follow President Chen at this Pharmacist Conference.” 

“And Su Tianshuo said that if we don’t agree, he will kill us brothers and sisters. On this 
Yaoding Mountain, killing one or two people will not be discovered by anyone. We have 
no choice but to ask Fellow Daoist Chen to spare us…” 

Nie Lei kept kowtowed, tears streaming down his face! 

When Nie Hong saw her brother like that, her eyes turned red and she cried! 

“You two are too much. Do you want to betray Mr. Chen for your own benefit?” 



“Thanks to Mr. Chen for being so kind to take you two with him, you two are worse than 
pigs and dogs!” 

Nie Heng angrily scolded the brother and sister! 

Originally, they all had the same surname, and Nie Heng had a good feeling about the 
brother and sister, but he didn’t expect them to be this kind of people! 

“David, kill them both. Keeping this kind of people will be a disaster sooner or later!” 

Liu Ruyan also said angrily! 

When Nie Lei heard this, he was so scared that he trembled all over and kept 
kowtowing! 

That Nie Hong also knew that he was scared at this moment, and his face became very 
ugly, no longer the way he looked when he just put on the moral hat! 
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“Thinking that you two are also forced to do nothing, I will spare you!” 

David looked at the two brothers and sisters kneeling on the ground, and finally spared 
them! 

“Thank you, Mr. Chen, thank you, Mr. Chen…” 

Nie Lei kowtowed desperately! 

Then he pulled Nie Hong up and turned to walk down the mountain! 

“Where are you two going?” David asked! 

“This Yaoding Mountain is too dangerous. It is not a place for us brothers and sisters to 
stay. Let’s go down the mountain.” 

“And if we don’t report our location to Su Tianshuo, he won’t spare us. Let’s run for our 
lives as soon as possible!” 

Nie Lei said! 

“Do you think you two brothers and sisters can get out of this poisonous fog?” 

David continued to ask! 



Nie Lei was silent. If they didn’t have the detoxification pill and David’s pill to absorb the 
toxins, they would not be able to get out of this poisonous fog with their bodies! 

“You two should follow me, or continue to report your location to Su Tianshuo!” 

David said! 

“Don’t dare, absolutely don’t dare…” 

Nie Lei waved his hand hurriedly! 

It was good enough that David could spare them. How dare they tip off Su Tianshuo! 

“I asked you to report, so you report. This is also to paralyze Su Tianshuo and let him 
not doubt you!” 

“Su Tianshuo has united many people and plans to use the hands of Zhantian Fazong 
to reshuffle the pharmacists of the entire Tianren world.” 

“It is estimated that many pharmacists will die this time, so I must expose Su Tianshuo’s 
conspiracy!” 

The reason why David asked Nie Lei’s brothers and sisters to continue to report was to 
paralyze Su Tianshuo! 
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As long as we can find a way to make Su Tianshuo reveal his conspiracy, I believe 

that many pharmacists will not let Su Tianshuo go! “What? Su Tianshuo wants to target 
the pharmacists of the entire Tianren world, not just you?” 

Liu Ruyan was shocked. She didn’t expect that Su Tianshuo would have such a big 
conspiracy! 

“Mr. Chen, let’s go quickly. We must notify others as soon as possible. If Su Tianshuo 
succeeds, the entire pharmacist world will be a disaster!” 

Nie Heng urged anxiously! 

“Okay, let’s go!” 



After David finished speaking, he waved his hand, and suddenly a fire burned fiercely! 

Soon, the dead bodies on the ground, as well as the Diao family pharmacists who were 
not dead, were all burned to ashes by the fire! 

Looking at the raging fire in front of him, Nie Lei’s forehead was full of cold sweat. 
Fortunately, David let them go! 

Otherwise, they would become part of the raging fire and become ashes! 

David’s strength is not something they can shake at all! 

They are so naive that they want to cooperate with Su Tianshuo to divide the Hundred 
Years of Offerings of the Demon Sealing League! If 

David is really killed, I am afraid that they will not be able to get the Hundred Years of 
Offerings of the Demon Sealing League! 

Without absolute strength, the best way to save your life is to keep a low profile! 

David and his team are moving very fast, because they have elixirs, so they don’t have 
to worry about being poisoned! 

The fog quickly retreated in front of their eyes! 

I don’t know how long it took, David and his team finally walked out of the foggy area! 

At this time, Su Tianshuo and others who were still in the fog were anxiously waiting for 
Diao Changmin! 

“Chairman Su, let’s leave this place first and look for the head of the Diao family!” 

“Although the fog here is not poisonous, it will hurt the body if you stay for a long time.” 

“Our detoxification pills can’t remove the toxins at all!” 
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Bao Longxing said to Su Tianshuo! 

Su Tianshuo frowned, his face became very ugly: “Damn, this Diao Changmin, took all 
the family members away, what on earth does he want to do?” 

“When he took people away in the end, did he say what he was going to do?” 



“No, but he seemed to leave in a hurry, but I heard from others that Diao Changmin 
should have taken people away after receiving the report from the brother and sister.” 

“Will this guy take his clansmen to catch David?” 

Bao Longxing said! 

Su Tianshuo listened, his eyes condensed slightly, his face was terribly cold! 

“This Diao Changmin, I know what he did, he must have gone to catch David, this guy 
wants to take it all for himself, he has been thinking about the medicine cauldron on 
David all the way.” 

“If he dares to eat alone, let me catch him, I must kill him…” 

Su Tianshuo gritted his teeth, not to mention how angry he was! 

Now the plan has not been implemented, and this kind of thing has happened in his 
team, how can he not be angry! 

“President Su, why don’t you contact Nie Lei and his sister and ask what’s going on?” 

Bao Longxing said! 

“No, if we contact them rashly, it will be troublesome for David to notice it.” 

“After a while, their brother and sister will take the initiative to contact again, and then 
we will know what the situation is. Let’s go now, no more waiting!” 

Su Tianshuo didn’t plan to wait for Diao Changmin! 

So many people are waiting in the poisonous fog. If the poisoning is too deep, it will be 
troublesome! 

Bao Longxing nodded, then greeted everyone and began to move forward! 

None of them knew that Diao Changmin and his clansmen had been killed by David at 
this time, and they were wiped out! 

After penetrating the fog, Su Tianshuo and others all stopped, breathing heavily and 
resting! 

Even with detoxification pills, the toxins in the body cannot be eliminated. Now they can 
only stop and rely on spiritual power to slowly force the toxins out! 
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Yaoding Mountain, halfway up the mountain! 

David led Liu Ruyan and the others to continue climbing to the top of the mountain! 

On the way, they also met many pharmacists sparsely, most of whom knew David and 
greeted David! 

But David did not tell them about Su Tianshuo! 

After all, David did not know whether these pharmacists were Su Tianshuo’s people, 
and even if they were not Su Tianshuo’s people, David said that the other party might 
not believe it! 

Now David had to find Chen Wenliang and Zhen Yuandao and the others as soon as 
possible. Only by making these people believe it, and then slowly spreading the news, 
could it work! 

“Fellow Daoist Chen, I have been looking for you all the way, why are you so slow?” 

Just as David and the others were heading towards the top of the mountain, Chen 
Wenliang stopped him! 

“President Chen, I was delayed by something, so I entered the mountain a little late!” 

David was relieved when he saw Chen Wenliang! 

Now that I meet Chen Wenliang, I can tell him about Su Tianshuo’s conspiracy first. 

“No wonder I didn’t see you along the way.” After Chen Wenliang finished speaking, he 
saw Nie Lei and Nie Hong, brother and sister, and said curiously: “You two are actually 
with fellow Daoist Chen, I even sent someone to look for you two.” “ 

This Yaoding Mountain is not safe, with your strength, don’t run around everywhere!” 

“Got it, President!” Nie Lei and Nie Hong, brother and sister, were embarrassed and 
ashamed! 

Just now they said that they were at the bottom of the Central Domain Pharmacist 
Association and no one paid attention to them. Now Chen Wenliang not only 
remembers them, but also sent people to look for them. It can be seen that he is not 
bad for the two people! 



“President Chen, I have something to tell you, come with me!” 

David called Chen Wenliang to a hidden place! 

After all, Chen Wenliang also brought a lot of pharmacists with him, and David didn’t 
know if there were any of them who were colluding with Su Tianshuo! 

Like Nie Lei and Nie Hong, brother and sister, although they are also pharmacists of the 
Central Domain Pharmacist Association, they are colluding with Su Tianshuo! 

“Fellow Daoist Chen, what’s going on? It’s so mysterious? ” Chen 

Wenliang 

asked puzzledly! 

“President Chen, do you know what Su Tianshuo, the president of the Western Region 
Pharmacist Association, is up to?” 

David asked! 

“Intent? What intention?” Chen Wenliang was stunned! 

“Let me tell you the truth. Su Tianshuo colluded with Zhan Tian Fa Zong to attack Yao 
Shen Island. He contacted many pharmacists and planned to reshuffle the pharmacist 
world in the Tianren world!” 

“If we don’t stop it this time, I’m afraid that many pharmacists will die on Yao Shen 
Island.” 

David said! 

“What?” Chen Wenliang’s eyes widened, his face full of disbelief: “You said that Su 
Tianshuo is going to attack the pharmacists of the entire pharmacist world? He doesn’t 
have the courage, right?” 

“And how did you know about the collusion with Zhan Tian Fa Zong?” 

David knew that no one would believe it easily, so he told Chen Wenliang the details of 
what happened! 

But even so, Chen Wenliang still couldn’t believe that Su Tianshuo had such courage! 

David had no choice but to call Nie Lei and Nie Hong! 

After Nie Lei and Nie Hong said it, Chen Wenliang believed it! 



But this also gave him a headache. After all, even if he said it, no one would believe it! 

After all, everyone on Yaoding Mountain is a competitor. Maybe everyone thinks he is 
exaggerating and deliberately scaring everyone to leave Yaoding Mountain! 

“I can only persuade the many pharmacists of the Central Region Pharmacist 
Association to be careful, but other people may not believe what I say.” 

Chen Wenliang said! 

“I understand. Now we go to the Zhou family and the Zhen family. If we convince them, 
we will have bargaining chips against Su Tianshuo and others.” “ 

Even if other pharmacists don’t believe it at that time, Su Tianshuo can’t succeed at all.” 

David said! 
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David nodded, and then followed Chen Wenliang and others to the top of the mountain! 

I believe that most of the pharmacists will be there when they reach the top of the 
mountain! 

But not long after David and his team moved forward, there were suddenly several loud 
noises! 

Boom… 

Crack! 

Thunders suddenly fell from the top of the mountain and struck not far from David and 
his team! 

At this time, several deep pits were instantly struck by thunder on the mountain, and the 
blasted gravel came towards everyone! 

Seeing this scene, many pharmacists were shocked! 

David waved his hand casually, and a barrier appeared to block the gravel, otherwise 
these gravel would definitely hurt people! 



“What’s the situation? No one has broken through, how can there be a thunder 
tribulation?” Chen 

Wenliang asked in confusion! 

“This is not a thunder tribulation…” 

David looked up at the sky. There was no thunder tribulation cloud in the sky, so this 
thunder was not a thunder tribulation! 

“It’s not a thunder tribulation? What is it?” 

Chen Wenliang asked! 

“This should be a test, a test of the God of Medicine?” David said! 

“Test? What does that mean? How can there be a test of the God of Medicine?” 

Chen Wenliang was very puzzled. They had been here all the way, and they hadn’t 
seen any test of the God of Medicine! 

“President Chen, didn’t you encounter any danger along the way?” 

David asked curiously! 

“No, I did encounter some monsters, but they were all killed. There was no other 
danger!” 

Chen Wenliang shook his head! 

“It seems that the tests encountered when going up the mountain from different 
directions are different.” 
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David told Chen Wenliang about what he had experienced! 

Especially when encountering the light curtain and poisonous fog, these are also 
considered tests! 

When Chen Wenliang heard this, his expression became solemn. He had never heard 
that there was a test on Yaoding Mountain. Now it seems that it is not so easy to get to 
the top of the mountain and get the inheritance of the God of Medicine! 

“Mr. Chen, look…” 



Nie Heng pointed to the sky and said! 

From the top of Yaoding Mountain, wisps of blue light emerged. These lights gathered 
in the sky, and then countless lightning shuttled through the blue light, making crackling 
sounds! 

It seemed that these thunder and lightning would soon strike down. With so many 
thunder and lightning, everyone was afraid that there was no place to hide! 

“These troubles, we really can’t avoid them? I don’t know how powerful this thunder is, 
can we rely on our own cultivation to bear it!” 

Chen Wenliang frowned and said! 

Boom! 

Just as Chen Wenliang’s voice fell, a thunder came down and hit a pharmacist directly! 

The pharmacist vomited blood and fell to the ground with serious injuries! 

Although he was not dead yet, he was seriously injured. If he came again, he would 
definitely die! 

Everyone who saw this scene was scared! 

Chen Wenliang directed everyone to start treating the pharmacist who was seriously 
injured! 

But at this time, the thunder and lightning became more and more dense, and they 
could all come down at any time! 

At this time, everyone had no idea, and they looked at Chen Wenliang with an 
extremely ugly face! 

As the president, Chen Wenliang, they can only count on Chen Wenliang to give an 
idea! 

But Chen Wenliang was helpless at this time, his face full of anxiety! 

Faced with this sudden thunder test, Chen Wenliang seemed helpless, and the 
pharmacists were terrified and at a loss. 

At this time, David’s eyes were extremely firm. He knew that in such a critical moment, 
someone must stand up and lead everyone through the difficulties. 



“Don’t panic!” David’s voice penetrated the thunder and seemed unusually calm. “We 
must unite and face this test together. I believe that as long as we work together, we will 
find a way to crack it.” 
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But this area was covered by thunder, and there was no room to hide! 

Boom! 

Another thunder came down, and a pharmacist was hit again, and fell to the ground 
instantly! 

This time, everyone panicked and rushed to escape! 

“Don’t mess around, running around at this time will only lead to death!” 

David hurriedly stopped them! 

“Listen to Brother Chen, no one is allowed to mess around, no one moves!” 

Chen Wenliang also stopped everyone from running around! 

Running around at this time is the most unwise choice! 

Rumble… 

The thunder is still bombarding, but not every time it hits people! 

When it hits the ground, a huge deep pit will be formed! 

After several thunders bombarded, David’s eyes suddenly lit up! 

He noticed that the thunder did not seem to attack indiscriminately, but selectively fell in 
certain areas. 

This made him realize that perhaps there was a way to predict or avoid the 
bombardment of thunder. 

“Everyone, pay attention, thunder seems to follow a certain specific trajectory.” David 
quickly analyzed, “We need to find this pattern and use it to avoid thunder.” 



Upon hearing this, Chen Wenliang immediately organized the pharmacists to assist 
David in observation and analysis. 

After some intense discussions, they found that thunder always prioritized attacking 
those with lower cultivation or weaker physique. 

Perhaps this was the deliberate arrangement of the God of Medicine, so that those with 
low strength were eliminated! 

This is also the reason why Ouyang Xing did not allow people with low cultivation to 
enter Yaoding Mountain! 
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These people entered Yaoding Mountain, fearing that they would not see the 
inheritance of the God of Medicine, and would be wiped out! 

“All the pharmacists below the fifth level of the Tribulation Realm are gathered together, 
and the pharmacists with higher cultivation are surrounded. We need to form a shield to 
protect these pharmacists.” 

David proposed that the pharmacists with higher cultivation form a circle to protect 
those with lower cultivation. 

“Are you all ready? We are going to start the action!” David shouted loudly. 

Under David’s command, the pharmacists acted quickly and arranged their formations 
according to the plan. 

With a roar, another thunder fell, but this time, it was blocked by the pharmacists with 
higher cultivation and did not cause any damage. 

Seeing this, everyone’s confidence increased greatly, and according to David’s 
instructions, they moved towards the top of the mountain step by step. 

Although thunder continued to fall on the way, under the leadership of David, the 
pharmacists relied on wisdom and courage to escape danger again and again. 

However, just after they traveled a distance, the thunder in the sky suddenly became 
more dense and violent, as if it was going to swallow up the entire Yaoding Mountain. 

“Everyone be careful, this is the most critical moment!” David reminded loudly. 

This thunder is also like the poisonous fog, the deeper it goes, the more powerful it is. 
Now is the critical moment. As long as they rush through here, they will withstand the 
test of thunder! 



With several thick thunder and lightning roaring down, the powerful pharmacists around 
them burst out their spiritual power desperately to form a shield to protect the less 
powerful pharmacists in the center! 

But after these lightning bolts, the shield shattered, and several pharmacists were 
directly knocked out, and fell to the ground seriously injured! 

Seeing this scene, Chen Wenliang was shocked! 

Seeing that the thunder in the sky was forming again and was about to strike again, 
everyone’s face was full of fear! 

“President Chen, you guys go, don’t worry about us…” 

said a pharmacist with lower strength! 

“Yes, President Chen, you can run if you can, otherwise we will all die here!” 

“The treasures of Yaoding Mountain are really not so easy to get, accept your fate!” 

Many pharmacists are waiting for the arrival of death! 

 


