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Chapter 4161 

“I have never heard of the cause of the disease you mentioned. It seems that I still need 
to learn more.” 

“Originally, I didn’t want to participate in any pharmacist conference. I felt it was a waste 
of time. This pharmacist conference is nothing more than a place for those medicine 
masters to seek fame and reputation.” 

“Now I have changed my mind. I can’t live with my old ideas. Thank you!” 

Zhong Qing patted David’s shoulder gratefully! 

Originally, Zhong Qing had no interest in any pharmacist conference, but now he has, 
because the appearance of David made him realize that he still knows too little! 

He has never heard of the cause of the disease that David mentioned! 

“Senior Zhong, there must be a teacher among three people. In addition to improving 
yourself in medical skills, you must also work hard in your emotions.” 

“I believe that Grandma Zhen can see your efforts.” 

David smiled! 

Zhong Qing was slightly stunned, and then she laughed: “I will…” 

“But you have to pay more attention. After all, the hundred-year offering of the Demon 
Sealing League is very tempting. Even if Emperor Xiao protects you, there must be 
brave men under the heavy reward, you have to be on guard!” 

Zhong Qing reminded David! 

Although he has the Xiao Dynasty as a backing, he can’t guarantee that no one will 
have any intentions towards David! 

“Thank you, Senior Zhong, for reminding me. I will pay attention!” 

David nodded! 



“Friend Chen, you’d better leave here as soon as possible. Before going to Yaoshen 
Island, it’s best not to walk around casually!” 

Chen Wenliang stepped forward to remind David to leave! 

After all, there are so many people on the scene, no one can guarantee that no one will 
have any intentions towards David! 

If someone suddenly attacks David, it is simply impossible to guard against it! 

David returned to the Zhen family with Liu Ruyan and Nie Heng! 

Zhen Huan and Zhou Silang also went back with him! 

Zhen Huan didn’t care much about David’s identity, but she was still very curious about 
what David said about lovesickness! 

After all, girls all hope to have a man who loves them wholeheartedly! 

“Silang, if I suddenly disappear, will you get lovesick? Just like Prince Xiao?” 

After returning to the Zhen Mansion, Zhen Huan asked Zhou Silang! 

“Of course, without you, my life has no meaning!” 

Zhou Silang took Zhen Huan’s hand and said affectionately! 

After hearing this, Zhen Huan raised the corner of her mouth and leaned on Zhou Silang 
with satisfaction! 

David looked at Zhen Huan and Zhou Silang and smiled helplessly. He didn’t think 
highly of these two people. 

Maybe Zhen Huan has feelings for Zhou Silang, but Zhou Silang definitely doesn’t have 
much love for Zhen Huan! 

The combination of the two of them, to put it bluntly, is a combination of interests! 

For the sake of the two families, they are combined together! 

As long as interests are mixed in the relationship, the relationship is not pure! 

But this is everyone’s choice, and David has no right to ask! 

During the few days at the Zhen family, David did not go out, but listened to Chen 
Wenliang’s words and stayed at home! 



He has been practicing the combination of divine patterns and demon patterns these 
days. Although David still doesn’t know what the Heaven and Earth Array is, since the 
ancestor of divine patterns has said that only he can break the Heaven and Earth Array, 
David must work hard! 

“Mr. Chen, notify to go to Medicine God Island…” 

Three days later, Nie Heng informed David that he could go to Medicine God Island! 

David walked out of the room and followed Nie Heng to the square of Yongle City! 

At this time, many pharmacists had already gathered here! 

These pharmacists have passed the assessment, but they should thank Zhong Qing! 

If it weren’t for Zhong Qing, it is estimated that more than half of the pharmacists here 
would not be able to go to Medicine God Island! 

With the order of Su Tianshuo, many pharmacists began to line up according to their 
own regions! 

David directly chose Chen Wenliang’s Central Region Pharmacist Association, and Liu 
Ruyan and Nie Heng also stood in the Central Region Pharmacist Association team! 
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Zhong Qing also came, but he stood in the Zhen family’s team, and Grandma Zhen also 
came! 

It can be seen that Grandma Zhen and Zhong Qing should have reconciled their past 
grudges! 

After standing in line, there were also some casual cultivators, standing together in twos 
and threes! 

Then everyone began to walk towards the port outside Yongle City! 

One spiritual boat after another was neatly placed in the port, these were all sent by 
Yaoshen Island! 

After boarding the spiritual boat, they began to slowly head towards Yaoshen Island! 



After about seven or eight hours of sailing, Yaoshen Island not far away could already 
be clearly seen! 

Many people rushed to the bow and looked at the Yaoshen Island in front of them! 

After all, many people have only heard of Yaoshen Island, but have never been there! 

David looked at the Yaoshen Island. The area was not particularly large, but it was 
several times larger than Yongle City! 

But compared with the area of tens of thousands of miles in the Tianren Realm, 
Yaoshen Island is not too big! 

The Medicine God Island is lush with green trees, and there are many birds and beasts 
flying in the sky! 

As we get closer, the buildings on the Medicine God Island can be clearly seen! 

The magnificent buildings are magnificent and much more luxurious than those in 
Yongle City! 

Even more solemn and dignified than the buildings of the Western Region Pharmacist 
Association! 

The entire Medicine God Island seems to have a fairy spirit, giving people a misty 
feeling, like a fairy island! 

In the center of the island is a mountain shaped like a medicine cauldron. The mountain 
is extremely high, and there are several small peaks at the foot of the mountain, shaped 
like the legs of a medicine cauldron! 

Seeing this strange mountain, everyone couldn’t help but marvel! 

It feels that nature is too ingenious. Why are there mountains in such a shape! 

“This mountain is called Yaoding Peak. Legend has it that it is the medicine cauldron of 
the God of Medicine. The God of Medicine refines various elixirs in this medicine 
cauldron.” 

“Later, the Medicine God fell, and the entire Medicine Cauldron turned into a mountain. 
In this mountain, there are many elixirs refined by the Medicine God. As for whether you 
can find it, it depends on your ability.” 

Ouyang Wufeng walked in front of everyone and introduced the Medicine Cauldron 
Peak loudly! 



Everyone was amazed when they heard Ouyang Wufeng’s words. Regardless of 
whether this Medicine Cauldron Peak was the Medicine God’s Medicine Cauldron, the 
shape was too similar. It was simply ingenious and coincidental. 

As the spirit boat docked, everyone got off the boat. Only then did they really see that 
the entire Medicine God Island was still very large. There were many pharmacists 
walking around on it, and the atmosphere was very lively! There were 

even many other monks walking around on the Medicine God Island. There were not 
only pharmacists on the Medicine God Island! 

And the buildings on the Medicine God Island could clearly see a dividing line, and the 
architectural styles on both sides of the dividing line were somewhat different! 

“This is the most famous West Square Street on our Yaoshen Island. There are many 
businesses here, not only pharmacists on Yaoshen Island.” 

“Yaoshen Island was once a barren land, but after so many years of development, it has 
become very prosperous.” 

“There will also be many monks who come to Yaoshen Island to live for various 
reasons. Our place is no worse than Yongle City.” 

Ouyang Wufeng said with pride to everyone. 

Everyone’s perception of Yaoshen Island has also changed completely at this moment. 
The barren land and the particularly desolate scene have not appeared in everyone’s 
eyes! 

On the contrary, Yaoshen Island actually has some meaning of a paradise. If there is 
really something difficult to say, you can come to Yaoshen Island to live again! 

Ouyang Wufeng personally led everyone, arranged accommodation, and even 
thoughtfully prepared fairy grass and elixir for everyone! 

You must know that there are no fewer pharmacists coming to Yaoshen Island this time. 
Now Yaoshen Island has prepared so many things, which can be regarded as a capital 
investment! 

However, this can also improve the status of Yaoshen Island in everyone’s hearts. It is 
estimated that after this time, many people want to stay in Yaoshen Island! 
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After settling down, many people walked out of their residences and went around the 
island! 

This Medicine God Island is simply a tourist destination, with mountains, forests, 
beaches and seas! 

If it were in the secular world, it would definitely become a tourist hotspot! 

David followed Liu Ruyan and Nie Heng out of their residence and began to wander 
around the entire Medicine God Island! 

There are also many businesses on the entire island, but most of them are related to 
pharmacists! 

There are also some people holding signs seeking medical treatment and asking for 
medicine, and they can use various treasures in exchange for treatment methods! 

It is estimated that these people do not have the strength to get on the medical list, so 
they use this method to get the attention of the pharmacist and then treat them! 

“I really didn’t expect that this Medicine God Island would be so lively. I always thought 
it was a deserted island.” 

Liu Ruyan looked at the vendors on both sides and said in surprise! 

“Yes, I have heard of Medicine God Island a long time ago. It was the place where 
those pharmacists who practiced magic were exiled. Now it has become so prosperous. 
How can it still be a desolate island?” Nie 

Heng also sighed! 

David smiled. After so many years of development, Medicine God Island has become 
such a scene. It seems that Ouyang Wufeng’s father is definitely a master! 

At least he is a talent in governance and management to make Medicine God Island 
what it is now! 

Whether it is an ordinary cultivator or a pharmacist, they are all orderly. The vendors on 
both sides of the road are also well-behaved. No one is seen making trouble! 

You must know that there are many cultivators in the Tribulation Realm on this street. 
They all like to fight, but these people dare not do so on Medicine God Island! 



It can be seen that the rules of Medicine God Island are very strict, which can restrain 
the people on the island! 

The vendors on both sides sell a wide variety of things. After all, the people who come 
here are from all over the world. No wonder the houses are built in different styles! 

However, more people want to treat their injuries and then reward them.Items! 

“Old man, your granddaughter is suffering from dementia. If she is cured, I am afraid 
there will be dozens of purple gold spirit coins.” 

“And you only took out some broken herbs as a reward. Are you treating people as 
fools?” 

“It seems that you are also a pharmacist. Don’t you understand?” 

Just when David was strolling on the street with Liu Ruyan and Nie Heng, he suddenly 
heard someone shouting in dissatisfaction not far ahead! 

“That’s right, this is treating others as fools. If there is no reward, you may also use your 
granddaughter to pay off the debt. I think this little girl is pretty.” 

“She looks good, but it’s a pity that she looks a little stupid. I can’t get my appetite at all!” 

A circle of people were pointing and talking! 

At this time, an old man said with embarrassment: “Fellow Taoists, I am also a 
pharmacist, but unfortunately I don’t have the ability to heal my granddaughter. I have 
been here for a long time and I really don’t have anything to show for it.” 

“There are only these worthless herbs. If anyone can heal my granddaughter, I can 
work like a cow or a horse for him.” 

David, who was not far away, was stunned when he heard this voice, and then frowned! 

He didn’t want to meddle in other people’s business and planned to go around, but 
when he heard the old man’s voice, he stopped directly! 

“Your work is useless. If you can heal your granddaughter, can you let your 
granddaughter stay with you for a few nights?” 

“Yes, if you can stay with him for a few nights, I can help him heal.” 

“I can also heal her, and I can also ask the people of the Ouyang family of Medicine 
God Island to come forward for treatment.” 



Everyone began to make a fuss. In fact, there may not be too many people who can 
really heal her. 

“Let’s go and take a look…” David took Liu Ruyan and Nie Heng and walked over! 

“Mr. Chen, do you know him?” Nie Heng asked! 

“The voices sound familiar, but they can’t possibly come here?” 

David frowned and quickened his pace! 
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“Everyone, we are all pharmacists. I hope you can be kind in your words. If you can heal 
my granddaughter, I will definitely repay you.” 

“If you can’t, please leave and don’t talk nonsense here!” 

The old man’s face turned ugly! 

How could he not be angry when someone humiliated his granddaughter like this! 

“Get out of the way, all of you…” 

At this time, five burly guys pushed through the crowd and came in! 

“Who is it? So awesome, let us get out of the way?” 

“Damn, isn’t this the Five Heroes of Nanfang? Let’s stay away.” 

“What are these five guys doing here? They are not pharmacists, and they can’t treat 
illnesses.” 

“Who knows, don’t provoke them.” 

Everyone made way! 

The old man looked at the five strong men who suddenly appeared, his face changed 
slightly, put away his stall, and prepared to leave with his granddaughter! 

The Five Heroes of Nanfang, anyone who has been on Medicine God Island for a 
period of time knows them! 



These five guys are evil and are not pharmacists at all, but they are doing very well on 
Medicine God Island! 

Because there are also many cultivators on Medicine God Island who are not 
pharmacists, and these cultivators are arranged to live in Nanfang! 

And the Five Heroes of Nanfang rely on their strength to control the entire Nanfang! 
However, 

these five guys judged the situation and did not dare to offend the Ouyang family. 
Instead, they made a lot of efforts for the Ouyang family to manage Medicine God 
Island. Therefore, these five guys were not expelled from Medicine God Island, but were 
appreciated by the island owner! 

This time, the five guys became even more unscrupulous and acted rampant on 
Medicine God Island! 

However, they only dared to bully some new casual cultivators who came to Medicine 
God Island. They didn’t dare to bully any of the indigenous people of Medicine God 
Island who had a relationship with the Ouyang family! 

“Old thing, why do you leave when you see us? Aren’t you curing your granddaughter? 
We can too!” 

As the boss of the Five Heroes of the South, he grabbed the old man and said! 

“You are not pharmacists, how can you cure me ?We don’t want to see your 
granddaughter anymore!” 

The old man shook his head and tried to break free, but found that he couldn’t break 
free from the restraints of the leader of the Five Heroes of Nanfang! 

“We are not pharmacists, but we know a lot of pharmacists. I can help you find a 
pharmacist to cure your granddaughter’s illness.” 

The leader of the Five Heroes said with a smirk! 

“What do you want?” 

The old man asked, suppressing his anger! 

“You old thing, you ask knowingly, of course you want your granddaughter to 
accompany us brothers.” 

“I’ve seen it a long time ago, your granddaughter is not the original one, so don’t 
pretend to be pure.” 



The leader of the Five Heroes laughed! 

“Hahaha… It’s good enough that we brothers don’t despise her. “ 

“A pair of sluts, why are you pretending. “ 

The other five heroes burst into laughter! 

The old man was angry, completely angry, his eyes turned bloodshot! 

“I will fight you, you five beasts…” 

The old man roared, and slapped the leader of the five heroes with one palm! The 
leader of the five heroes 

was stunned, and suddenly a burst of spiritual energy burst out, like a huge wave 
rolling, and directly blew the old man away! 

At this moment, a figure instantly rose into the air and caught the old man directly! 

“Mr. Miao, are you okay? “ 

After David caught the old man, he asked softly! 

It turned out that the old man was Miao Lao who had been to Tianmo Mountain with 
David, and the girl was Miao Miao, Miao Lao’s granddaughter! 

After Miao Miao was violated in the battlefield of gods and demons, Miao Lao took his 
granddaughter away! 

Unexpectedly, they came to Yaoshen Island! 

“Chen… Mr. Chen…” 

Seeing David, Miao Lao burst into tears! 

Looking at Miao Lao’s appearance, David was also very touched in his heart. It has only 
been a short time, and Miao Lao seems to have aged a lot! 

And Miao Miao, the lively girl at the beginning, now looks like a fool, with dull eyes and 
muttering to herself! 
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“Little girl, come with me, I can help you with your medical treatment…” 

The boss of the Five Heroes stepped forward and pulled Miao Miao’s arm, and was 
about to take Miao Miao away! 

Snap! 

But at this moment, a big hand suddenly came over! 

The boss of the Five Heroes was caught off guard and was slapped directly! 

“If you dare to touch her again, you will die…” 

David said with cold eyes! 

“Damn it, you dare to hit me?” The 

boss of the Five Heroes had a cold face, his eyes were wide open, and full of anger! 

Liu Ruyan and Nie Heng walked behind David, and David said, “You two keep an eye 
on Miss Miao, don’t let anyone get close!” 

David was afraid that a fight would break out soon. So many people were staring at 
Miao Miao, and it would be bad if someone took the opportunity to attack! 

Now Miao Miao’s situation is obviously unconscious and mentally ill. Even if someone 
took the opportunity to take advantage of her, she would not resist! 

“Okay!” Liu Ruyan and Nie Heng nodded! 

Although they didn’t know what the relationship between David and the old man and the 
young man was, since David said it, they would listen! 

The Five Heroes Boss took a look at David and found that David was just a sixth-grade 
cultivator in the Tribulation Realm, so he said angrily: “A mere sixth-grade cultivator in 
the Tribulation Realm dares to meddle in other people’s business.” 

After that, the Five Heroes Boss slapped David with a palm. He wanted to avenge the 
palm he had just taken! 

The peak aura of the Tribulation Realm burst out in the body of the Five Heroes Boss, 
but just when the palm reached David, David stretched out his hand and directly 
grabbed the wrist of the Five Heroes Boss! 



At this moment, the Five Heroes Boss was stunned and wanted to take his hand back, 
but found that he couldn’t move at all! 

“Ah…” 

The Five Heroes Boss screamed instantly, and David’s fingers exerted a little force, and 
the Five Heroes Boss’s arm seemed to be broken, and it was painful! 

Seeing this, the other Five Heroes shouted in a stern voice: “Let go of my brother, let go 
quickly, or I’ll kill you!” 

These people were also at the peak of the Crossing Tribulation Realm, their auras 
surged, and their eyes were fierce! 

Seeing this, the people around them all dodged away, they didn’t dare to provoke the 
Five Heroes of Nanfang! 

Seeing this, Miao Lao hurriedly said to David: “Mr. Chen, thank you for your help, you 
should leave, don’t worry about it, you are not their opponent…” 

Miao Lao knew that David could not be the opponent of the Five Heroes of Nanfang at 
all, after all, the other party was at the peak of the Crossing Tribulation Realm! 

How could David, a sixth-grade Crossing Tribulation Realm, deal with five peak 
Crossing Tribulation Realm! 

“Miao Lao, I will take care of this matter today, you don’t have to be afraid.” 

After David finished speaking, he suddenly exerted force on his hand, and the arm of 
the Five Heroes boss was instantly broken! 

“Ah… Kill him, kill him…” 

The Five Heroes boss screamed! 

Seeing this, the other people rushed towards David together! 

Five peak masters of the Crossing Tribulation Realm, this kind of strength, even the 
newly promoted Mahayana cultivators dare not confront! 

But David was not afraid at all, the aura on his body exploded instantly, and there was a 
strong wind around him! 

Everyone was stunned. A sixth-grade cultivator in the Tribulation Realm was going to 
fight against five peak cultivators in the Tribulation Realm? 



Was this a joke? 

But looking at David, it didn’t seem like a joke! 

Seeing that the two sides were on the verge of a fight, a cold shout suddenly came: 
“Stop, you are fighting on Medicine God Island, don’t you want to live?” 

Several figures came quickly and landed between David and the Five Heroes of 
Nanfang! 

“Don’t you five know the rules? You dare to burst out your aura and want to have a big 
fight. Are you going to destroy this entire street?” 

One of the law enforcement cultivators in green clothes said coldly to the Five Heroes of 
Nanfang! 

“Deacons, please understand that it was this kid who started it first and broke my arm, 
so we had no choice but to fight.” 

The leader of the Five Heroes raised his arm that was broken by David and said! 

 


