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The Ex Husbands Revenge Chapter 2871-“What?” Felton and Jayden were 
both shocked. 

Jayden thought that Caleb was about to give up on protecting Leon because 
of what he said. 

To his bewilderment, Hugo and Renee managed to change his mind. Now, 
Caleb intends to neglect the family’s gain to protect Leon. 

Jayden was reluctant to accept this. 

“Dad, you need to think twice! The Morrisons shouldn’t declare war against 
the Fermers for an outsider’s sake! We will suffer losses for nothing,” Jayden 
said. 
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Before he could finish his sentence, Caleb cut him off. “Shut up, Jayden. I 
know what I’m doing. I don’t need you to teach me what to do,” Caleb roared 
with a dark expression. 

He knew that Jayden was doing this to protect the family as he did not wish 
for the Morrisons to work for Leon over nothing. 

However, Jayden was too short-sighted and could only consider the benefit 
before him, unlike Hugo. 

On top of that, Jayden caused troubles multiple times in the past that led to 
disputes with Leon. 

Given what happened in the past, there was no way that Caleb would repeat 
the same mistake and listen to Jayden again. 

“I-” Jayden’s heart sank in response to Caleb’s anger. 

Since Caleb’s mind was set, he could only give up and quiet down to prevent 
further provoking Caleb. 



“Who would have thought that the Fermers and the Morrisons would get at 
odds over an outsider!” “This is about to be good!” “Yeah. Once the Western 
Boss gets involved, things are going to get even better!” 

While waiting for Caleb to make up his mind, the other guests were all 
shaken. 

They all knew that the Morrisons and the Fermers were the two most powerful 
families in the western region. 

Though they were never friends, neither family would declare war against the 
other to preserve their gain. 

To their surprise, they now indeed to start a war for the sake of an outside. 

This was so surreal that everyone was dying to see who would win. 

They all assumed that the Western Boss would soon arrive and once that 
happened, there was no telling who would win. 

“Looks like the Morrisons are reliable after all,” Leon sighed an inward breath 
of relief. 

In the future, he could leave matters concerning Cynthion Group’s branch in 
the Morrisons’ hands when he was not around. 

 


